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The Secretariat General of the Federation of Arab Scientific Research Councils presents its 
compliments to the office for Outer space Peaceful Purposes, and would like to inform the 
honorable body that Federation is one of the Arab States League Organizations that is 
concerned with Scientific Research and Technology Development. As such, the Federation is 
composed of Membership of all the Arab World Countries.  The Federation is dependant in its 
programs on the mechanism of many Specialized Scientific Associations, including the 
Association of Arab Remote Sensing Centers, which been founded under Federation Council 
Decision No (6) 25/2002, which provides for the Great Jamahiriya to be its focal point. 
 
In view of the application submitted by the Association to obtain permanent observer status 
with the UN Committee on the Use of Outer Space for Peaceful Purposes and both its technical 
and legal subcommittees, we would like to point out that the Association of Arab Remote 
Sensing Centers enjoys an independent legal  and financial personality. The Association is 
under the auspices and reporting directly to the Federation. 
The Association Supreme Body is the (Authority) consists of all member states in the 
Association. This is expressly provided for in Article III of the Statutes of the Association, 
which states that “The Body of the Association consists of Directors of Centers or Officials 
responsible for Remote Sensing in the Arab States members of the Federation of Arab 
Scientific Research Councils’ Representatives of States, or their representative in attendance” 
.Each State has one vote regardless of the number of centers present for the meetings of the 
body. And if a tie occurs then the secretary’s side would be nominated. 
 
At the same time we hope that we highlighted the nature of some aspects of the work of the 
Association, we look forward to seeing the Association has received a Permanent Observer seat 
in the Committee of Outer Space for Peaceful Purposes to enhance its position and role in 
activating of the Arab Scientific work between the Association and the relevant International 
Organizations and bodies, also, looking forward to a more fruitful cooperation between your 
Committee and the Federation. 
 
[SIGNED BY] 
 
Dr. Mbarek Mohamed Ali Majdoub      
 
Federation of Arab Scientific Research Councils 
Secretariat General  
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